AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number: 4b

Consideration of an amendment to Municipal Code Title 15, “Buildings
Title: and Construction”, Section 15.04.025 “2021 International Swimming
' Pool & Spa Code—Regulations adopted and modified” regarding
CITY OF Swimming Pool Safety Barriers

ST. CHARLES

ILLINOLS + 1834 Presenter: | Russell Colby, Community Development Director
Meeting: Planning & Development Committee Date: July 8, 2024
Proposed Cost: N/A Budgeted Amount: N/A Not Budgeted: []

TIF District: None

Executive Summary (if not budgeted, please explain):

Background
In response to a resident comment at the June 17, 2024 Council meeting, staff was asked provide

information on code standards for pool safety barriers.

The resident referenced the “Private Swimming Pool Enclosure Act”. This State Act is proposed legislation
from the 1990s that was not adopted, although it is referenced on various websites as if it was state law.
The current state statute (attached) provides the City with the ability to adopt a barrier standard we deem
appropriate, meaning that the City’s current adopted codes are not in conflict with the state statute.

Code Standard

The City regularly adopts updated versions of the International Building Codes, generally every 6 years.
The current adopted codes are the 2021 edition, adopted by the City in 2022. The ability to use a Powered
Safety Cover as the sole barrier for in-ground pools in St. Charles dates back to 2016, when the City
adopted the 2015 set of International Codes.

The International Codes evolve over time based on industry standards for safety and construction. In
recent years Powered Safety Covers have become an accepted safety standard. In order to meet the code,
the pool cover must comply with the “ASTM F1346”, a standard developed by the ASTM International
(American Society for Testing and Materials), an organization that develops and publishes technical
standards for many products. This standard requires pool covers to support 485 pounds of weight.

The City has the ability to adopt local amendments to the International Code that are more restrictive or
require additional measures, particularly with respect to safety regulation. The City has not previously
created any local amendments for pool safety standards, and therefore there was no discussion of the
topic when the codes were updated in 2016 and 2022. As new code editions have been adopted during
the last few update cycles, the trend has been to eliminate existing local code amendments where
practical, in order to more closely follow industry standards.

Neighboring Communities

Neighboring communities vary as to whether they allow a Powered Safety Cover as the sole barrier, and
this is partly due to which edition of the International Codes they have adopted. Under codes prior to
2015, by default, fencing is required and could not be amended out of the adopted code.

Some jurisdictions with 2015 or later codes do allow for Powered Safety Covers as pool barriers. However,
based on available permit applications, it is unclear how this standard has been applied in practice, and
whether the jurisdiction approves permits for pools with Powered Safety Covers as the only barrier.




There are some municipalities that have adopted a local amendment to the 2015 or later codes that in
effect requires fencing, including Geneva. See the attached list.

Option for Local Amendment to Require Fencing
Staff does not have a specific recommendation to change the code. Use of Powered Safety Covers is an
accepted industry standard, however some jurisdictions in our area have chosen to still require fencing.

As with any construction or safety requirement, the safety measures are inspected at the time of permit,
but whether it be a pool cover or a fence, the safety measures are only effective as designed if they are
maintained properly by the property owner.

Fences have the benefits of:
e Providing an exterior access barrier, even while the pool is open and in-use
e Not relying on the user or owner to take any action to secure the exterior of the pool (assuming
the fence gate/latch is operational)
e Not relying on power or mechanical operation to secure the exterior (other than the fence latch)

If the City decides to amend the code to require fencing for all in-ground pools, the code may create a cost
disincentive for installation of a Powered Safety Cover.

Powered Safety Covers provide some benefits that fences do not, including:
e When closed, a full barrier that completely restricts access to the pool, and is designed to hold the
weight of two adults and a child
e Maintenance benefits of keeping pools free from debris, reducing water evaporation, and
insulating from water temperature loss
e Improved barrier protection for direct access from the house

Note regarding Interior Access to Pools

Discussion of this issue is focused on the perimeter fence around the exterior or outside of the pool, as a
barrier to entry from off site or from the yard. For a pool located immediately behind a house and directly
accessible from the house, there are also code standards that apply to access through doors from the
house. This standard can be met by a fence, a Powered Safety Cover or a door alarm system. Other
communities generally to do not amend this standard, and staff would not recommend the City adopt any
local amendments to this standard.

Attachments (please list):

State Statute and City Code

Comparison of nearby community regulations

2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code section on Barriers
Draft ordinance to amend the City Code

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain):

Provide direction and/or recommendation regarding an amendment to the City Code.




STATE STATUTE:

MUNICIPALITIES
(65 ILCS 5/) lllinois Municipal Code.

(65 ILCS 5/11-30-9) (from Ch. 24, par. 11-30-9)

Sec. 11-30-9. The corporate authorities may prescribe rules and regulations
for the construction of privately owned artificial basins of water used for
swimming or wading, which use or need external buttresses or which are dug into
the ground, located on private residential property and intended for the use of
the owner and guests.

The corporate authorities may by ordinance require the construction of fences
around or protective covers over previously constructed artificial basins of water
dug in the ground and used for swimming or wading, which are located on private
residential property and intended for the use of the owner and guests.

(Source: P.A. 86-1470.)

CITY CODE:
Title 15 — BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION
Chapter 15.04 - BUILDING CODE

15.04.025 - 2021 International Swimming Pool & Spa Code—Regulations adopted and
modified.

The provisions of the 2021 International Swimming Pool & Spa Code issued by the International
Code Council Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478, not less than one (1)
copy of which have been and are on file in the Office of the Clerk of the City of St. Charles,
Illinois for more than thirty (30) days, together with the amendments listed herein, are hereby
adopted.

Amendments to the 2021 International Swimming Pool & Spa Code:

1. Chapter 1 - Scope and Administration. The City has adopted a separate
Administrative Code under the Municipal Code Chapter 15.101.

a. Section 105.4.3 "Expiration - delete in its entirety.

b. Section 105.4.4 "Extensions - delete in its entirety.

c. Section 108.6. "Refunds - delete in its entirety.

d. Section 111 "Means of Appeal - delete in its entirety.

e. Section 112 "Board of Appeals - delete in its entirety.

f. Section 113.4 "Violation penalties - delete in its entirety.

(2022-M-30: § 1; Ord. No. 2016-M-16)



CODE STANDARDS OF NEARBY MUNICIPALITIES:

Is a Powered Safety Cover permitted as the sole safety barrier, based on adopted code?

Yes- Post-2015 codes- Allowed by code
Wayne

South Elgin

Kane County

DuPage County

West Chicago

Carol Stream

Warrenville

Sugar Grove

No- Post-2015 code- Amended out of the code
Geneva

North Aurora

Naperville

Wheaton

Bartlett

No- Pre-2015 Codes- No option to amend out of the code
Batavia

Elgin

Elburn

Campton Hills




GENERAL COMPLIANCE

303.1.2 Time switches. Time switches or other control
methods that can automatically turn off and on heaters
and pump motors according to a preset schedule shall be
installed for heaters and pump motors. Heaters and pump
motors that have built-in time switches shall be in compli-
ance with this section.

Exceptions:

1. Where public health standards require 24-hour
pump operation.

2. Pumps that operate solar- or waste-heat recov-
ery pool heating systems.

303.1.3 Covers. Ouidoor heated pools and outdoor
permanent spas shall be provided with a vapor-retardant
cover or other gpproved vapor-retardant means in accor-
dance with Section 104.12.

Exception; Where more than 70 percent of the energy
for heating, computed over an operating season, is
from a heat pump or solar energy source, covers or
other vapor-retardant means shall not be required.

303.2 Portable spas, The energy consumption of electric-
powered portable spas shail be controlled by the require-
ments of APSP 14,

303.3 Residential pools and permanent residential spas.
The energy consumption of residential swimming pools and
permanent residential spas shall be controlled in accordance
with the requirements of APSP 15.

SECTION 304
FLOOD HAZARD AREAS

304.1 General. The provisions of Section 304 shall control
the design and construction of pools and spas installed in
flood hazard areas.

[BS] 304.2 Determination of impacts based on Iocation.
Pools and spas located in flood hazard areas indicated
within the Infernational Building Code or the International
Residential Code shall comply with Section 304.2.1 or
304,2.2,

Exception: Pools and spas located in riverine flood
hazard areas that are outside of designated floodways
and pools and spas located in flood hazard areas where
the source of flooding is tides, storm surges or coastal
storms.

[BS] 304.2.1 Pools and spas located in designated
floodways, Where pools and spas are located in desig-
nated floodways, documentation shall be submitted to the
code official that demonstrates that the construction of the
pools and spas will not increase the design flood elevation
at any point within the jurisdiction.

[BS] 304.2.2 Pools and spas focated where floodways
have not been designated. Where pools and spas arc
located where design flood elevations are specified but
floodways have not been designated, the applicant shall
provide a floodway analysis that demonstrates that the
proposed pool or spa and any associated grading and fill-

‘awi

ing, will not increase the design flood elevation more than
I foot (305 mm) at any point within the jurisdiction.

[BS] 304.3 Pools and spas in coastal high-hazard areas.
Pools and spas installed in coastal high-hazard areas shall be
designed and constructed in accordance with ASCE 24.

{BS] 304.4 Protection of equipment. Equipment shall be
elevated to or above the design flood elevation or be
anchored to prevent flotation and protected to prevent water
from entering or accumulating within the components during
conditions of flooding.

304.5 GFCI protection. Electrical equipment installed
below the design flood elevation shall be supplied by branch
circuits that have ground-fault circuit interrupter protection
for personnel.

SECTION 305
BARRIER REQUIREMENTS

al; The provisions of this section shall apply to
{ barriers for restricting entry into areas having
hot tubs are equipped with a -
ble safefy .cover..complying with ASTM F1346 and:
mming pools are equippéd with'a. powered safety cover
that comiplies with ASTM F1346’the areas where those spas,
hot tubs or pools are located shall not be required to comply
with Sections 305.2 through 305.7.

305.1.1 Construction fencing required. The construc-
tion sites for in-ground swimming pools and spas shall be
provided with construction fencing to surround the site
from the time that any excavation occurs up to the time
that the permanent barrier is completed. The fencing shall
be not less than 4 feet (1219 mm) in height.

305.2 Outdoor swimming pools and spas. Qutdoor pools
and spas and indoor swimming pools shall be swrrounded by
a barrier that complies with Sections 305.2.1 through 305.7.

305.2.1 Barrier height and clearances. Barrier heights
and clearances shall be in accordance with ail of the
following:

1. The top of the barrier shall be not less than 48
inches (1219 mm) above grade where measured
on the side of the barrier that faces away from the
pool or spa. Such height shall exist around the
entire perimeter of the barrier and for a distance of
3 feet (914 mm}) measured horizontally from the
outside of the required barrier.

2. The vertical clearance between grade and the
bottom of the barrier shall not exceed 2 inches (51
mmy} for grade surfaces that are not solid, such as
grass or gravel, where measured on the side of the
barrier that faces away from the pool or spa.

3. The vertical clearance between a surface below
the batrier to a solid surface, such as concrete, and
the bottom of the required barrier shall not exceed
4 inches (102 mm) where measured on the side of
the required barrier that faces away from the pool
or spa.

2021 INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE®




4. Where the top of the pool or spa structure is above
grade, the barrier shall be installed on grade or
shall be mounted on top of the pool or spa struc-
ture. Where the barrier is mounted on the top of
the pool or spa, the vertical clearance between the
top of the pool or spa and the bottom of the barrier
shall not exceed 4 inches (102 ram).

305.2.2 Openings. Openings in the barrier shall not allow
passage of a 4-inch-diameter (102 mm) sphere.

305.2.3 Solid barrier surfaces. Solid barriers that do not
have openings shall not contain indentations or protru-
sions that form handholds and footholds, except for
normat construction tolerances and tooled masonry joints.

305.2.4 Mesh fence as a barrier, Mesh fences, other
than chain link fences in accordance with Section 305.2.7,
shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s
instructions and shall comply with the following:

1. The bottom of the mesh fence shall be not more
than 1 inch (25 mm) above the deck or installed
surface or grade.

2. The maximum vertical clearance from the bottom
of the mesh fence and the solid surface shall not
permit the fence to be lifted more than 4 inches
(102 mm) from grade or decking.

3. "The fence shall be designed and constructed. so
that it does not allow passage of a 4-inch (102
mm} sphere under any mesh panel. The maximum
vertical clearance from the bottom of the mesh
fence and the solid surface shall be not greater
than 4 inches (102 mm) from grade or decking.

4, An attachment device shall attach each barrier
section at a height not lower than 45 inches (1143
mm) above grade. Common attachment devices
include, but are not limited to, devices that
provide the security equal to or greater than that of
a hook-and-eye-type latch incorporating a spring-
actuated retaining lever such as a safety gate hook,

3. 'Where a hinged gate is used with a mesh fence,
the gate shall comply with Section 305.3.

6. Patio deck sleeves such as vertical post recepta-
cles that are placed inside the patio surface shall
be of a nonconductive material.

7. Mesh fences shall not be installed on top of
onground residential pools.

305.2.4.1 Setback for mesh fences, The inside of a
mesh fence shall be not closer than 20 inches (508
mm) to the nearest edge of the water of a pool or spa,

305.2.5 Closely spaced horizontal members. Where the
barrier is composed of horizontal and vertical members
and the distance between the tops of the horizontal
members is less than 45 inches (1143 mm), the horizontal
members shall be located on the pool or spa side of the
fence. Spacing between vertical members shall not exceed
1%/, inches (44 mm) in width. Where there are decorative
cutouts within vertical members, spacing within the
cutouts shall not exceed 1%/, inches (44 mm) in width.

2021 INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE®

GENERAL COMPLIANCE

305.2.6 Widely spaced horizontal members, Where the
barrier is composed of horizontal and vertical members
and the distance between the tops of the horizontal
members is 45 inches (1143 mm) or more, spacing
between vertical members shall not exceed 4 inches (102
min). Where there are decorative cutouts within vertical
members, the interior width of the cutouts shall not
exceed 1%, inches (44 mm),

305.2.7 Chain link dimensions. The maximum opening
formed by a chain link fence shall be not more than 1%/,
inches (44 mm). Where the fence is provided with slats
fastened at the top and bottom that reduce the openings,
such openings shall be not greater than 1°/, inches (44
mm),

305.2.8 Diagonal members. Where the barrier is
composed of diagonal members, the maximum opening
formed by the diagonal members shall be not greater than
1%/, inches (44 mm). The angle of diagonal members shall
be not greater than 45 degrees (0.79 rad) from vertical,

305.2.9 Clear zone. Where equipment, including pool
equipment such as pumps, filters and heaters, is on the
same lot as a pool or spa and such equipment is located
outside of the barrier protecting the pool or spa, such
equipment shall be located not less than 36 inches (914
mm) from the outside of the barrier.

305.3 Doors and gates. Doors and gates in barriers shall
comply with the requirements of Sections 305.3.1 through
305.3.3 and shall be equipped to accommodate a locking
device. Pedestrian access doors and gates shall open outward
away from the pool or spa, shall be self-closing and shall
have a self-latching device. ’

305.3.1 Utility or service doors and gates. Doors and
gates not intended for pedestrian use, such as utility or
service doors and gates, shall remain locked when not in
use.

305.3.2 Double or multiple doors and gates. Double
doors and gates or multiple doors and gates shall have not
fewer than one leaf secured in place and the adjacent leaf
shall be secured with a self-latching device.

305.3.3 Latch release, For doors and gates in barriers,
the door and gate latch release mechanisms shall be in
accordance with the following:

1. Where door and gate latch release mechanisms are
accessed from the outside of the barrier and are
not of the self-locking type, such mechanism shalt
be located above the finished floor or ground
surface in accordance with the following:

1.1. At publie pools and spas, not less than 52
inches (1219 mm) and not greater than 54
inches (1372 mm).

1.2. At residential pools and spas, not less 54
inches (1372 mm).

2. Where door and gate latch release mechanisms are
of the self-locking type such as where the lock is
operated by means of a key, an electronic opener
or the entry of a combination into an integral
combination lock, the lock operation control and

3-3




GENERAL COMPLIANCE

the latch release mechanism shall be located
above the finished floor or ground surface in
accordance with the following;
2.1. At public pools and spas, not less than 34
inches and not greater than 48 inches
(1219 mm).
2.2, Atresidential pools and spas, at not greater
than 54 inches (1372 mm).

3. At private pools, where the only latch release
mechanism of a self-latching device for a gate is
located on the pool and spa side of the barrier, the
release mechanism shall be located at a point that is
at least 3 inches (76 mm) below the top of the gate.

305.3.4 Barriers adjacent to latch release mechanisms.
Where a latch release mechanism is located on the inside
of a barrier, openings in the door, gate and barrier within
18 inches (457 mm) of the latch shall not be greater than
1/, inch (12.7 mm) in any dimension.

305.4 Structure wall as a barrier. Where a wall of a dwell-

ing or structure serves as part of the barrier and where doors,
] gates or windows provide direct access to the pool or spa

through that wall, one of the following shall be required:

1. Operable windows having a sill height of less than 48
inches (1219 mm) above the indoor finished floor,
| doors and gates shall have an alarm that produces an
audible warning when the window, door or their
screens are opened. The alarm shall be listed and
labeled as a water hazard entrance alarm in accor-

dance with UL 2017.

2. In dwellings not required to be Accessible -units,
Type A units or Type B units, the operable parts of
the alarm deactivation switches shall be located at

I not less than 54 inches (1372 mm) above the finished
floor,

I 3. Indwellings that are required to be Accessible units,
Type A units or Type B units, the operable parts of
the alarm deactivation switches shall be located not
greater than 54 inches (1372 mm) and not less than
48 inches (1219 mm) above the finished floor.

4. In structures other than dwellings, the operable parts
of the alarm deactivation switches shall be located
not greater than 54 inches (1372 mm) and not less
than 48 inches (1220 mm) above the finished floor.

5. A safety cover that is listed and labeled in accordance
with ASTM F1346 is installed for the pools and spas.

6. An approved means of protection, such as self-clos-
ing doors with self-latching devices, is provided.
Such means of protection shall provide a degree of
protection that is not less than the protection afforded
by Item 1 or 2,

305.5 Onground residential pool structure as a barrier.
An onground residential pool wall structure or a barrier
mounted on top of an onground residential pool wall struc-
ture shall serve as a barrier where all of the following
conditions are present:

1. Where only the pool wall serves as the barrier, the
bottom of the wall is on grade, the top of the wall is

3-4

not less than 48 inches (1219 mm) above grade for
the entire perimeter of the pool, the wall complies
with the requirements of Section 305.2 and the pool
manufacturer allows the wall to serve as a barrier.

2. Where a barrier is mounted on top of the pool wall,
the top of the barrier is not less than 48 inches (1219
mm) above grade for the entire perimeter of the pool,
and the wall and the barrier on top of the wall comply
with the requirements of Section 305.2.

3. Ladders or steps used as means of access to the pool
are capable of being secured, locked or removed to
prevent access except where the ladder or steps are
surrounded by a barrier that meets the requirements
of Section 305.

4. Openings created by the securing, locking or removal
of ladders and steps do not allow the passage of a 4-
inch (102 mm) diameter sphere.

5. Barriers that are mounted on top of onground resi-
dential pool walls are installed in accordance with
the pool manufacturer’s instructions.

305.6 Natural barriers. In the case where the pool or spa
area abuts the edge of a lake or other natural body of water,
public access is not permitted or allowed along the shoreline,
and required barriers extend to and beyond the water’s edge
not less than 18 inclies (457 mm), a barrier is not required
between the natural body of water shoreline and the pool or
spa.

305.7 Natural topography. Natural topography that
prevents direct access to the pool or spa area shall include
but not be limited to mountains and natural rock formations.
A natural barrier gpproved by the governing body shall be
acceptable provided that the degree of protection is not less
than the protection afforded by the requirements of Sectiong
305.2 through 305.5.

305.8 Means of egress. Outdoor public pools provided with
barriers shall have means of egress as required by Chapter 10
of the International Building Code.

SECTION 306
DECKS

306.1 General. The structural design and installation of
decks around pools and spas shall be in accordance with the
International Residential Code or the International Building
Code, as applicable in accordance with Section 102.7 and
this section,

306.2 Slip resistant. Decks, ramps, copi}1g, and simiiar step
surfaces shall be slip resistant and cleanable. Special features
in or on decks such as markers, brand insignias, and similar
materials shail be slip resistant.

306.3 Step risers and treads, Step risers for decks of public
pools and spas shall be uniform and have a height not less
than 3%, inches (95 mm) and not greater than 7'/, inches
(191 mm). The tread distance from front to back shall be not
less than 11 inches (279 mm). Step risers for decks of resi-
dential pools and spas shall be uniform and shall have a
height not exceeding 7Y, inches {191 mm). The tread

2021 INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE®




City of St. Charles
Ordinance No. 2024-M-

An Ordinance Amending Chapter 15.04 “Building Code”, Section 15.04.025
“2021 International Swimming Pool & Spa Code - Regulations Adopted and
Modified” of the St. Charles Municipal Code

BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of St. Charles, Kane and DuPage Counties,
Illinois as follows:

SECTION ONE: That Title 15, “Buildings and Construction”, Chapter 15.04 “Building
Code” of the St. Charles Municipal Code, Section 15.04.025 entitled “2015 International
Swimming Pool & Spa Code-Regulations adopted and modified”, be and is hereby amended by
adding the following Subsection “2. Chapter 3 — General Compliance”:

Amendments to the 2021 International Swimming Pool & Spa Code:

2. Chapter 3 — General Compliance.

a. Section 305.1 Barrier Requirements — General — Delete and replace with the
following: The provisions of this section shall apply to the design of barrier for
restricting entry into areas having pools and spas. Where spas or hot tubs are
equipped with a lockable safety cover complying with ASTM F1346, the areas where
those spas or hot tubs are located shall not be required to comply with Sections 305.2
through 305.7. Swimming Pools shall comply with 305.2 through 305.7, regardless of
the existence of a powered safety cover.

SECTION TWO: That after the adoption and approval hereof this Ordinance shall be
printed or published in book or pamphlet form, published by the authority of the City Council.

Presented to the City Council of the City of St. Charles, Illinois this __ day of
,2024.

Passed by the City Council of the City of St. Charles, Illinois this day of
,2024.

Approved by the Mayor of the City of St. Charles, Illinois this day of



Ordinance No.
Page 2

,2024.

Attest:

City Clerk

Council Vote:

Ayes:

Lora A. Vitek, Mayor

Nays:

Abstain:

Absent:






